Slide 1

Slide 2

Slide 3

INTERPRETING THE FLORIDA
EXISTING BUILDING CODE

Presented by the Building Officials Association of Florida, Inc.
Provider # 0001001

Based on the 2007 Florida Building Code
and 2009 Supplement

COURSE INFORMATION

Course: Interpreting The Florida Existing
Building Code
Course #: CILB: TBA
BCAIB: TBA
AlA: # 10G001
FBPE: # 546
Instructor:
Location:
Date:
Credit: 3.0 CE Hour

The ABuilding Officials Associ
Registered Provider with The American Institute of Architects
Continuing Education Systems. Credit earned on completion

of this program will be reported to CES Records for AIA
members. Certificates of Completion for non-AIA members

are available on request.

This program is registered with the AIA/CES for continuing
professional education. As such, it does not include content
that may be deemed or construed to be an approval or
endorsement by the AIA of any material of construction or any
method or manner of handling, using, distributing, or dealing
in any material or product. Questions related to specific
materials, methods, and services will be addressed at the
conclusion of this presentation. W,
2

'u

WUlp,

A




Slide 4

Slide 5

Slide 6

Copyright Materials

This presentation is protected by US and International
Copyright laws. Reproduction, distribution, display and use
of the presentation without written permission of The
Building Officials Association of Florida, Inc. is prohibited.

© The Building Officials Association of Florida, Inc. 2010

LEARNING OBJECTIVES

Upon completion of this course, you will be
better able to:

Interpret and understand the scope and
application of the FBC-Existing Building
Volume.

Understand the different classifications of
work.

Understand the differences between the three
levels of alteration.

Understand the requirements for additions,
changes of occupancy and historic buildings.

FLORIDA BUILDING CODE &
EXISTING BUILDING

Classification Of Work
Repairs

Alterations Level |
Alterations Level 11
Alterations Level 111
Change Of Occupancy
Additions




Slide 7

Slide 8

Slide 9

ADMINISTRATION
Chapter 1

TITLE 8 101.1

These regulations shall be known as
the Florida Building Code, Existing
Building , hereinafter
codeo.

In addition to the provisions of this
chapter, the provisions of Chapter 1,
Florida Building Code, Building
shall govern the administration and
enforcement of this code.

ScoPE 6 101.2

The provisions of the Florida
Building Code, Existing Building
shall apply to the repair, alteration,
change of occupancy, addition and
relocation of existing buildings.
Exception for public educational and
state licensed facilities, which are
referenced to Ch. 4 of the FBC &
Building.




Slide 10

Slide 11

Slide 12

INTENT & 101.3

The intent of this code is to provide
flexibility to permit the use of
alternative approaches to achieve
compliance with minimum
requirements to safeguard the public
health, safety and welfare insofar as
they are affected by the repair,
alteration, change of occupancy,
addition and relocation of existing
buildings.

APPLICABILITY 0 101.4

This code shall apply to the repair,
alteration, change of occupancy,
addition and relocation of all existing
buildings, regardless of occupancy,
subject to the criteria of Sections
101.4.1 and 101.4.2.

BUILDINGS NOT PREVIOUSLY
OccuPIED 6 101.4.1

A building or portion of a building that
has not been previously occupied or used
for its intended purpose in accordance
with the laws in existence at the time of
its completion shall comply with the
provisions of the Florida Building Code o
Building or Florida Building Code 0
Residential , as applicable for new
construction or with any current permit
for such occupancy.




Slide 13

Slide 14

Slide 15

BUILDINGS NOT PREVIOUSLY
OccuPiED 6 101.4.1

Translation d This section addresses
two issues:
Buildings completed but not
occupied where permits have
expired.
Buildings completed but not
occupied where permits are kept
current.

BUILDINGS NOT PREVIOUSLY
OccuPIED 0 101.4.1

Where permits were allowed to
expire, the building or portion
thereof is required to comply with
the code in effect at the time
occupancy of the building is being
sought.

Where permits are current,
compliance with the code in effect on
the date of permit application is
permitted.

BUILDINGS NOT PREVIOUSLY
OccuPIED 6 101.4.1

Example: Shell Building
As long as the shell building
permit was current (i.e. building
completed and permit finaled)
build-out permits would be issued
in accordance with the code in
effect on the date of the original
permit application for the shell
building.




Slide 16

Slide 17

Slide 18

BUILDINGS PREVIOUSLY
OccuUPIED 6 101.4.2

The legal occupancy of any building
existing on the date of the adoption
of this code shall be permitted to
continue without change, except as is
specifically covered in this code, the
Florida Fire Prevention Code , or as
deemed necessary by the code official
for the general safety and welfare of
the occupants and the public.

COMPLIANCE METHODS &
101.5

The repair, alteration, change of
occupancy, addition or relocation of
all existing buildings shall comply
with one of the methods listed in
Sections 101.5.1 through 101.5.3 as
selected by the applicant.

COMPLIANCE METHODS &
1015

Application of a method shall be the sole
basis for assessing the compliance of work
performed under a single permit unless
otherwise approved by the code official.
Sections 101.5 shall not be applied in
combination with each other.

Exception for buildings constructed in
compliance with the laws in existence at
the time the building was
constructed***¢




Slide 19

Slide 20

Slide 21

COMPLIANCE METHODS &
101.5

Three compliance methods are
established by this section:
Prescriptive Compliance 8 101.5.1
Work Area Compliance 8 101.5.2
Performance Compliance 6 101.5.3
This section limits the construction
and enforcement to the provisions of

the compliance method specified by
the applicant.

COMPLIANCE METHODS &
101.5

There is one exception to the three
compliance methods that may be
considered a fourth method of
compliance with alterations.

The exception allows compliance
with the laws in existence when the
building or affected portion of the
building was built.

COMPLIANCE METHODS &
1015

The exception essentially provides a
fourth option for compliance by allowing
alterations to meet the code in effect at
the time the building was built.

Not permitted when the work involves
substantial structural damage as defined
by Section 506.2.2 or if undergoing more
than a limited structural alteration as
defined in Section 807.5.3.




Slide 22

Slide 23

Slide 24

PRESCRIPTIVE COMPLIANCE
METHOD 6 101.5.1

Repairs, alterations, additions and
changes of occupancy complying with
Ch. 3 of this code in buildings
complying with the Florida Fire
Prevention Code shall be considered
in compliance with this code.

TRANSLATION

In order to apply the Prescriptive
Compliance Method, the building
must be in compliance with the
Florida Fire Prevention Code.

If necessary, the permit application
must include items required to bring
the building into compliance with
the Florida Fire Prevention Code.

WORK AREA COMPLIANCE
METHOD 8 101.5.2

Repairs, alterations, additions,
changes in occupancy and relocated
buildings complying with the
applicable requirements of Chapters
4 through 12 of this code shall be
considered in compliance with the
provisions of this code.




Slide 25

Slide 26

Slide 27

WORK AREA COMPLIANCE
METHOD 6 101.5.2

Chapters 4 through 12 contain
provisions that are based on a
proportional approach to compliance
where upgrades are triggered by the
type and extent of the work and the
percentage of the building area
involved in the work.

This was the only compliance
method available in the 2004 edition
of the code.

PERFORMANCE COMPLIANCE
METHOD & 101.5.3

Repairs, alterations, additions,
changes in occupancy and relocated
buildings complying with Chapter 13
of this code shall be considered in
compliance with the provisions of
this code.

PERFORMANCE COMPLIANCE
METHOD 6 101.5.3

Chapter 13 provides a method for
performing an evaluation of a building
based on fire safety, means of egress and
general safety.

Under this method, the owner is required
to commission an investigation and
evaluation of the building by an architect
or engineer.

The results are required to be submitted
to the building code official.




Slide 28

Slide 29

Slide 30

DEFINITIONS
Chapter 2

IMPORTANT DEFINITIONS

Existing Building & A building or
structure or portion of a building or
structure which has been previously
legally occupied or used for its
intended purpose.

IMPORTANT DEFINITIONS

Primary Function 8 A primary function is
a major activity for which the facility is
intended.

Examples include:
Customer service lobby of a bank
Dining area of a restaurant
Meeting rooms in a conference center
Offices or other work areas in which the
activities of the public accommodation
or other private entity using the facility
are carried out.




Slide 31

Slide 32

Slide 33

IMPORTANT
DEFINITIONSé continuen

Mechanical rooms, boiler rooms,
supply storage closets, employee
lounges, locker rooms, janitorial
closets, entrances, corridors and
restrooms ARE NOT areas
containing a primary function.

IMPORTANT DEFINITIONS

Repair 0 The patching, restoration
and / or minor replacement of
materials, elements, components,
equipment and / or fixtures in good
or sound condition.

The definition of repair is a Florida
specific amendment!

FURTHER DISCUSSION

2006 IEBC Definition of Repair &

0The restoration to
condition of any part of an existing
building for the purpose of its

mai ntenanceo.

The terms opatchingod
repairé added to the
of the definition may lead to
misunderstandings.

9




Slide 34

Slide 35

Slide 36

FURTHER DISCUSSION

The repair of buildings that have
sustained structural damage due to
a hurricane or other event is subject
to the provisions of Ch. 5, Repairs.
Where the damage does not exceed
either of the thresholds established

in the definition for

structural damage6,
may using materials and strengths
that existed prior to the damage.

r

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Example:
When a building located in the wind-
borne debris region was erected prior
to code requirements for glazed-
opening protection, broken glazing
may be replaced with like materials
and strength that existed prior to
the damage.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Even when the required repairs
affect more than 50% of the
aggregate building area, it is a
repair and not a Level 3 Alteration.
Such repair work is subject to Ch. 5
of the code and is not subject to Ch.
6, 7 and 8.




Slide 37

Slide 38

Slide 39

FURTHER DISCUSSION

When the damage is Oj
structur al damageo,
must be performed by a registered
design professional to determine the
extent that the repairs have to
comply with the current code.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

In any event, the repairs are
required to comply with Ch. 5 and
are not subject to Ch. 6, 7 and 8 for
alterations.

The intent of the code is to allow
repairs to return the building to the
pre-damaged condition and not
require the building to be made to
comply with the current edition of
the code.

IMPORTANT DEFINITIONS

Work Area 8 That portion or portions of a
building consisting of all reconfigured
elements, systems or spaces as indicated
on the construction documents.

Work area excludes other portions of the
building where incidental work entailed
by the intended work must be performed
and portions of the building where work
not initially intended by the owner is
specifically intended by the code.




Slide 40

Slide 41

Slide 42

PRESCRIPTIVE
COMPLIANCE
METHOD
Chapter 3

PRESCRIPTIVE COMPLIANCE
METHOD

Chapter 3, Prescriptive Compliance,
addresses the first of three
compliance methods.

The code requires the applicant to
designate the compliance method for
the project.

The method selected shall be the sole
basis for determining compliance of
the work performed.

PRESCRIPTIVE COMPLIANCE
METHOD

The code prohibits combining the
provisions of the three compliance
methods.

All work must be under a single
permit unless otherwise approved by
the building official.

When different compliance methods
are selected, separate permits should
be issued.




Slide 43

Slide 44

Slide 45

ADDITIONS,
ALTERATIONS OR

REPAIRS
Section 302

EXISTING BUILDINGS OR
STRUCTURES 6 302.1

Additions or alterations to any
building or structure shall comply
with the Florida Building Code &
Building for new construction.

An existing building plus additions
shall comply with the height and
area provisions of the Florida
Building Code & Building .

STRUCTURAL 8 302.2

Additions or alterations to an existing
structure shall not increase the force in
any structural element by more than 5%
unless the increased forces on the element
are still in compliance with the code for
new structures nor shall the strength of
any element be decreased to less than that
required by the Florida Building Code 8
Building for new structures.




Slide 46 ALTERATIONS TO TRUSSES &
302.2.4

Truss members and components shall not
be cut, notched, drilled, spliced or
otherwise altered in any way without
written concurrence and approval of a
registered design professional.
Alterations resulting in the addition of
loads to any member shall not be
permitted without verification that the
truss is capable of supporting such
additional loading.

Slide 47
STAIRWAYS & 302.4

An alteration or the replacement of
an existing stairway in an existing
structure shall not be required to
comply with the requirements of a
new stairway as outlined in section
1009 of the Florida Building Code 0
Building where the existing space
will not accommodate a stairway
meeting the current code
requirements for new construction.

Slide 48

FIRE ESCAPES
Section 303




Slide 49

Slide 50

Slide 51

WHERE PERMITTED 0 303.1

Fire escapes shall be permitted only as
provided for in Section 303.1.1 through
303.1.4.

The use of fire escapes is all but obsolete.
They are prohibited except for on existing
buildings where proper exterior stairs
cannot be provided due to the proximity of
property lines, space limitations or other
similar reasons.

NEwW BUILDINGS 6 303.1.1

Fire escapes shall not constitute any
part of the required means of egress
in new buildings.

EXISTING FIRE ESCAPES &
303.1.2

Existing fire escapes shall be
continued to be accepted as a
component in the means of egress in
existing buildings only.




Slide 52 ACCEPTABLE FOR CONTINUED

UsE

Slide 53
CHANGE OF
©® OCCUPANCY
Section 305
[ ]
Slide 54

CONFORMANCE 8 305.1

No change shall be made in the use or occupancy
of any building that would place the building in a
different division of the same group of occupancy
or in a different group of occupancies, unless such
building is made to comply with the
requirements of the Florida Building Code &
Building for such division or group of occupancy.




Slide 55

Slide 56

Slide 57

CONFORMANCE 8 3 0 5 . cdnénuep

Subject to the approval of the building
official, the use or occupancy of existing
buildings shall be permitted to be changed
and the building is allowed to be occupied
for purposes in other groups without
conforming to all the requirements of the
FBC 8 Building for those groups, provided
the new or proposed use is less hazardous,
based upon life and fire risk, than the
existing use.

CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY
0 305.2

A certificate of occupancy shall be
issued where it has been determined
that the requirements for the new
occupancy classification have been
met.

STAIRWAYS 0 305.3

Existing stairways in an existing
structure shall not be required to
comply with the requirements of a
new stairway as outlined in Section
1009 of the Florida Building Code 0
Building where the existing space
and construction will not allow a
reduction in pitch or slope.




Slide 58

Slide 59

Slide 60

CLASSIFICATION OF
WORK
Chapter 4

CLASSIFICATION OF WORK

Correct classification of work is
essential to properly applying the
Florida Building Code, Existing
Building .

CLASSIFICATION OF
WORKGe continuep

For example, during a severe
thunderstorm a fallen tree damages
a section of wall and the glass in a
number of windows is broken.

Is replacement of the damaged
portion of wall and the glass a repair
or an alteration?




Slide 61

Slide 62

Slide 63

CLASSIFICATION OF
WORKGe continuen

If the work is to correct damage from
a storm or other event, such as a fire,
or termite damage, or even a person
driving a vehicle into the building,
the work is a repair and is subject to
either Chapter 5 or, where the
Prescriptive Method is selected,
Chapter 3.

CLASSIFICATION OF
WORKGe continuen

This holds true REGARDLESS of
how much of the building is affected,
Ch. 4 contains the criteria for
classifying the work, general
provisions for the use of the chapter
and the code, and the charging
sections for assigning the relevant
chapters to the various work
classifications.

CLASSIFICATION OF
WORKGe continuep

Chapter 4 also addresses critical
issues such as the determination of
occupancy class, who selects or
designates the work classification
and the treatment of work on
undamaged components necessary to
complete the repair.




Slide 64

Slide 65

Slide 66

Scope 6 401.1

The provisions of Ch 4. shall be used
in conjunction with Chapters 5
through 12 and shall apply to the
alteration, repair, addition and
change of occupancy of existing
structures, including historic and
moved structures.

The work performed on an existing
building shall be classified in
accordance with Ch. 4.

SCOPE 6 4011e CONTINUED

The scope establishes that Ch. 4 is
used in conjunction with the work
area method, changes of occupancy,
additions, historic buildings and
relocated buildings.

This section also mandates that all
work done on an existing building is
required to be classified in
accordance with Ch. 4.

WORK AREA 0 401.2

The work area, as defined in Chapter
2, shall be identified on the
construction documents.

As defined, the work area consists of
all reconfigured spaces where work
is occurring.




Slide 67

Slide 68

Slide 69

WORK AREA 6 4012e CONTINUED

Do not confuse the word
oreconfiguredo6 in
work area with the use of the same
term in describing Level 2
Alterations.

While not involving the
reconfiguration of the space, the
work area method may be used in
Level 1 Alterations.

t

h e

ELECTION OF LEVEL 6 401.4

A design professional or an owner
must elect one or a combination of
levels of alteration pursuant to
Sections 403, 404 and 405 of this
code.

ELECTION OF LEVEL 0 401.4¢

CONTINUED

While this may seem to conflict with
the provisions of Ch.1 prohibiting
the combining of compliance
methods, this is actually a different
issue.

This section relates to the various
levels of one of the compliance
methods, the work area method.




Slide 70

Slide 71

Slide 72

ELECTION OF LEVEL 0 401.4¢

CONTINUED

This section recognizes the level of
work may vary on a single floor or on
different floors within a building.
Example:
The suspended ceiling of a floor
may be replaced as a Level 1
Alteration while a portion of the
floor where walls creating office
spaces are being reconfigured is
treated as a Level 2 Alteration.

REPAIRS
Section 402

ScoPE 0 402.1

Repairs, as defined in Chapter 2,
include the patching or restoration
or replacement of damaged
materials, elements, equipment or
fixtures for the purpose of
maintaining such components in
good or sound condition with respect
to existing loads or performance
requirements.




Slide 73

Slide 74

Slide 75

APPLICATION 0 402.2

Repairs shall comply with the provisions
of Chapter 5.

Repairs may include considerable work to
the entire building.

Ch. 5 provides the code provisions
governing repairs to existing structures.
The intent is to provide a reasonable
degree of safety without requiring the
entire building to meet the current code.

RELATED WORK 9 402.3

Work on nondamaged components
that is necessary for the required
repair of damaged components shall
be considered part of the repair and
shall not be subject to the provisions
of Chapter 6, 7, 8, 9 or 10.

RELATED WORK &
402.3é CONTINUED

Example:
The concrete balcony slabs on a building
are deteriorating and spalling. In order
to repair the concrete, the sliding glass
doors must be removed. The removal
and replacement of the doors is not
required to be classified as a Level 1 or
2 Alteration and is considered part of
the repair. As such, the doors may be
reused.




Slide 76

Slide 77

Slide 78

ALTERATIONS 0O

LEVEL 1
Section 403

ScoPE 6 403.1

Level 1 alterations include the
removal and replacement or the
covering of existing materials,
elements, equipment or fixtures
using new materials, elements,
equipment or fixtures that serve the
same purpose.

SCOPE 0 403.1¢ conminuen

Level 1 alterations shall not include
any removal, replacement or
covering of existing materials,
elements, equipment or fixtures
undertaken for the purpose of repair
as defined in Chapter 2 and
described in Section 402.




Slide 79

Slide 80

Slide 81

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Level 1 alteration represent the most
basic level of building alteration
Includes the removal and
replacement or the covering of
existing materials, elements,
equipment or fixtures that are not
part of a repair.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Examples include the replacement of
windows and doors, the recovering of a
roof.

The replacement of broken glass is
classified as a repair.

The replacement of the entire window and
frame assembly would be a Level 1
Alteration.

If the frame was replaced due to damage
to the frame, it would be considered a
repair.

APPLICATION 0 403.2

Level 1 alterations shall comply with
the provisions of Chapter 6.

Ch. 6 provides detailed requirements
for Level 1 alterations.

Historic buildings must comply with
Ch. 6 as modified by Ch. 11 of the
FBC & Existing Building.




Slide 82

Slide 83

Slide 84

ALTERATIONS 0O

LEVEL 2
Section 404

SCOPE 0 404.1

Level 2 alterations include the
reconfiguration of space, the addition
or elimination of any door or
window, the reconfiguration or
extension of any system, or the
installation of any additional
equipment.

APPLICATION 0 404.2

Level 2 alterations shall comply with
the provisions of Chapter 6 for Level
1 alterations as well as the
provisions of Chapter 7.




Slide 85

Slide 86

Slide 87

ALTERATIONS 0O

LEVEL 3
Section 405

ScoPE 8 405.1

Level 3 alterations apply where the
work area exceeds 50% of the
aggregate area of the building and
made within any 12 month period.
Exception;
Work areas in which the alteration
work is exclusively plumbing,
mechanical or electrical shall not
be included in the computation of
total area of all work areas.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Where a work area or combination of work
areas exceeds ¥z of the aggregate building
area within a 12 month period, it is
considered to be a Level 3 Alteration and
is governed by the provisions contained in
Chapter 8.

A number of important considerations
must be taken into account when
classifying work as a Level 3 Alteration.




Slide 88

Slide 89

Slide 90

FURTHER DISCUSSION

The total work area may consist of a
combination of Level 1 and Level 2
Alterations.

The area where work occurs outside
the intended work area due to
supplemental code requirements is
not included in calculating the total
work area.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Example:
Where a Level 2 Alteration exceeds
50% of a floor area, provisions
related to the enclosure of a floor
opening connecting 2 or more floors
are applied throughout the floor as
required per Section 703.2.2.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

The provision requires work to occur
in areas outside the originally
intended work area.

Those floor areas are not considered
when calculating the total work area
to determine if it exceeds 50% of the
aggregate building area.




Slide 91

Slide 92

Slide 93

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Repairs are not considered part of
the work area.

Work areas in which the work
involves work on only electrical,
plumbing or mechanical systems are
not included in calculating the total
of all work areas.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Example:
A 3 story building is undergoing
alterations on all 3 floors. The 1stfl. is
being reconfigured throughout. The 2nd
and 3¢ fl. are undergoing alterations to
upgrade the HVAC and plumbing systems
and increasing the number of electrical
receptacles. In calculating the total of all
work areas, the 2" and 3" floors would
not be included.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Finally, Section 405.1 limits the time
frame for the alterations to those
occurring within a 12 month period.
This permits the building owner to
phase alterations over time without
requiring compliance with the Level
3 requirements.




Slide 94

Slide 95

Slide 96

CHANGE OF
OCCUPANCY
Section 406

ScoPE 6 406.1

Change of occupancy provisions
apply where the activity is classified
as a change of occupancy as defined
in Chapter 2:

OA change in the
activity within a building that
involves a change in application of
the requirements

purp

of

t

APPLICATION 0 406.2

Changes of occupancy shall comply
with the provisions of Chapter 9.




Slide 97

Slide 98

Slide 99

FURTHER DISCUSSION

A change in occupancy may result in
a change in the level of hazard.

The code requires the evaluation of
various features of the building and
bases compliance on whether the
change is to an equivalent, lesser or
greater hazard.

ADDITIONS
Section 407

ScopPE 407.1

Provisions for additions shall apply
where work is classified as an
addition as defined in Chapter 2:

0OAn extension or incr
area, number of stories, or height of
a building or structu

This term is applicable only to
existing buildings, never new ones.




Slide 100

Slide 101

Slide 102

APPLICATION 8 407.2

Additions to existing buildings shall
comply with the provisions of
Chapter 10.

REPAIRS
Chapter 5

PURPOSE

Chapter 5 provides reasonable
regulations for the repair of
damaged structures.

It presents regulations to cover
materials, life safety, accessibility
and structural considerations.




Slide 103

Slide 104

Slide 105

PU RPOSE&¢ continuep

Structural damages are divided into:
Substantial structural damages
Less than substantial structural
damages

Also provided are limited provisions

for the repair of systems, such as

electrical, mechanical and plumbing
systems.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Repairs are described in the Scope at
Section 402 as the patching or
restoration or replacement of
damaged materials, elements,
equipment, or fixtures for the
purpose of maintaining such
components in good or sound
condition.

Operative word is damaged.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Updating, modi f-ypdg,
modernizing, freshening, renovating,

or removing and replacing ARE

NOT repairs.

Repairs entail the correction of

damaged elements or systems within

the building.




Slide 106

Slide 107

Slide 108

STRUCTURAL
Section 506

GENERAL 8 506.1

Repairs of structural elements shall
comply with Section 506.
Nonstructural repairs exclusive of
fixtures and furniture, the cost of
which does not exceed 25% of the
replacement value of the existing
building or structure, with the
approval of the building official, may
be made of the material of which the
building or structure is constructed.

WIND DESIGN 06 506.1.2

Wind design of existing buildings
shall be in accordance with the

building codes that were in effect
when the building was permitted.




Slide 109

Slide 110

Slide 111

REPAIRS TO DAMAGED
BUILDINGS 6 506.2
Repairs to damaged buildings shall

comply with this section and to
Section 611, Reroofing.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

This section provides the charging
language for the repair of damaged
buildings.

All damaged buildings must meet
the provisions of Chapter 5 OR
Chapter 3 where the Prescriptive
Compliance Method is permissible
and selected.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

The primary concern in determining
how repairs are to be accomplished
is establishing the extent of the
damage sustained.

Is the damage substantial or less
than substantial?




Slide 112

Slide 113

Slide 114

FURTHER DISCUSSION

When less than substantial structural
damage, Section 506.2.4 applies and the
repairs can be limited to restoring the
building to its pre-damaged state.

When the building has suffered
substantial structural damage, the
approach to repairs is dependent on
whether the damage is to elements of the
lateral system or only to elements of the
vertical load-carrying system.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

There are two repair requirements
that are not related to the extent of
the damage:
Dangerous conditions, which must
always be eliminated. 5 conditions
are defined in Ch. 2 that are
deemed as oO0Odangerous
Any new structural member must
meet the code requirements for
new construction.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Substantial structural damage is divided into two
categories:

Damage reducing the load-carrying capacity of
the lateral force resisting system (vertical or
horizontal elements) by more than 20%.

Damage reducing the capacity of the vertical
(gravity) load-carrying components supporting
more than 30% of the floor or roof area(s) to a
vertical load-carrying capacity below 75% of that
required by the FBC 8Building.




Slide 115

Slide 116

Slide 117

EVALUATION 8 506.2.2.1

The building shall be evaluated by a
registered design professional and
the evaluation findings shall be
submitted to the code official.

The evaluation shall establish
whether the damaged building, if
repaired to its pre-damaged state,
would comply with the provisions of
the codes in effect when the building
was permitted.

EVALUATION &
506221e CONTINUED

Wind loads for this evaluation shall
be those prescribed in the codes in
effect when the building was
permitted.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

Note that this section contains a
number of Florida specific
amendments to the base code.

The purpose of the evaluation is to
determine whether or not the
building when repaired to its pre-
damaged state, would comply with
the codes in effect when the building
was permitted.




Slide 118

Slide 119

Slide 120

FURTHER DISCUSSION

If the evaluation demonstrates that
the building complies with the codes
in effect when the building was
permitted, the building need only be
repaired to the pre-damaged
condition.

If not, it must be rehabilitated in
accordance with section 506.2.2.3.

ALTERATIONS 0
LEVEL 1
Chapter 6

FOR DISCUSSION

Chapter 6 contains the requirements
for buildings undergoing alterations
or renovations NOT RELATED to
repairs.

Level 1 Alterations are the simplest
of alterations and typically have the
least potential for impacting life
safety within a building.




Slide 121
FOR DlSCUSSlONé CONTINUED

Example:
All the interior partitions and the
entire plumbing and mechanical
systems in a multi-story building
may be removed and replaced with
new materials and equipment
without the alteration rising above a
Level 1 Alteration.

Slide 122
CONFORMANCE 0 601.2

An existing building or portion
thereof shall not be altered such that
the building becomes less safe or
energy efficient than its existing
condition.

Slide 123

MEANS OF EGRESS
Section 604




Slide 124

Slide 125

Slide 126

GENERAL 8 604.1

Means of egress for buildings undergoing
alteration shall comply with the
requirements of Section 601.1 and the
scoping provisions of Ch. 1 where
applicable.

Exception:
In residential dwellings and dwelling
units, a maximum 5% reduction in the
clear opening dimensions of replacement
windows and doors shall be allowed.

FURTHER DISCUSSION

The section on means of egress is
very poorly written as it does not
contain language to maintain the
protection for and access to the
existing means of egress.

STRUCTURAL
Section 606




Slide 127

Slide 128

Slide 129

GENERAL 98 606.1

Where alteration work includes
replacement of equipment that is
supported by the building or where a
reroofing permit is required, the
structural provisions of Section 606
shall apply.

The intent is to make certain new
equipment does not exceed the load
carrying capacity of the structure.

DESIGN CRITERIA - 606.2

Existing structural components supporting
alteration work shall comply with Section
606.2.

Exception:
Nonstructural alterations exclusive of fixtures
and furniture, the cost of which does not
exceed 25% of the replacement value of the
existing building or structure, with the
approval of the building official may be made
of the same material of which the building or,
structure is constructed (FL. Specific amend.)

ADDITION OR REPLACEMENT
OF ROOFING OR EQUIPMENT
0 606.2.1

Where addition or replacement of
roofing or equipment results in
additional dead loads, structural
components supporting such
reroofing or equipment shall comply
with the vertical load requirements
of the Florida Building Code &
Building.

3 Exceptions.




Slide 130

Slide 131

Slide 132

REROOFING
Section 611

GENERAL 8 611.1

Materials and methods of application
used for recovering or replacing an
existing roof covering shall comply
with the requirements of Chapter 15
of the Florida Building Code -
Building .

Roof repairs to existing roofs and
roof coverings shall comply with the
provisions of this code.

611.1.1 6 FL. SPECIFIC
AMENDMENT!

Not more than 25% of the total roof
area or roof section of any existing
building or structure shall be
repaired, replaced or recovered in
any 12 month period unless the
entire roofing system or roof section
conforms to requirements of this
code.




Slide 133

Slide 134

Slide 135

The provisions of the Wind
Mitigation Rule have been added to
the Florida Building Code - Existing
Building in the 2009 Supplement.
Sections 611.7.1 through 611.8.1.7.

ALTERATIONS 0
LEVEL 2
Chapter 7

FOR DISCUSSION

Chapter 7 addresses buildings
undergoing Level 2 Alterations
which include the reconfiguration of
space, the elimination of any door or
window, the reconfiguration or
extension of any system or the
installation of any additional
equipment.




Slide 136

Slide 137

Slide 138

FOR DISCUSSION

Level 2 Alterations are possible the
most frequent alterations
encountered in existing buildings.
The intent of the code is to allow
rejuvenation and rearrangement of
areas of the building without
requiring the total building to
impacted by the work.

FOR DISCUSSION

The code requires all new
construction associated with a Level
2 Alteration to comply with the
Florida Building Code & Building .

ScoPE 6 703.1

The requirements of this
section are limited to work
areas in which Level 2
alterations are being
performed, and shall apply
beyond the work area
where specified.




Slide 139

Slide 140

Slide 141

INTERIOR FINISH & 703.4

The interior finish of walls and ceilings in
exits and corridors in any work area shall
comply with the requirements of the
Florida Building Code, Building

Exception: Existing interior finish
materials that do not comply with the
interior finish requirements of the Florida
Building Code, Building shall be
permitted to be treated with an approved
fire-retardant coating in accordance with
the manufacturer6s i ngytH
the required rating

FIRE PROTECTION
Section 704

ScoPE 0 704.1

The requirements of this section
shall be limited to work areas in
which Level 2 alterations are being
performed, and where specified they
shall apply throughout the floor on
which the work areas are located or
otherwise beyond the work area.




Slide 142

Slide 143

Slide 144

AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER
SYSTEMS 6 704.2

Automatic sprinkler systems shall be
provided in accordance with the
requirements of Sections 704.2.1
through 704.2.5. Installation
requirements shall be in accordance
with the Florida Building Code -
Building .

MEANS OF EGRESS
Section 705

ScoPE 6 705.1

The requirements of this section
shall be limited to work areas that
include exits or corridors shared by
more than one tenant within the
work area in which Level 2
alterations are being performed, and
where specified they shall apply
throughout the floor on which the
work areas are located or otherwise
beyond the work area.




Slide 145

Slide 146

Slide 147

NUMBER OF EXITS 8 705.3

The number of exits shall be in
accordance with the appropriate
sections of the Florida Fire
Prevention Code.

Exception: Building of Group R3
occupancies shall comply with the
Florida Building Code - Building.

ALTERATIONS 0

LEVEL 3
Chapter 8

FOR DISCUSSION

Level 3 Alterations are defined as
when the work area exceeds 50% of
the total of the area of the building
and is made within any 12 month
period.

Areas where the work is exclusively
electrical, mechanical or plumbing
are not included when calculating
the size of the work area.




Slide 148

Slide 149

Slide 150

FOR DISCUSSION

The provision applies to a single
work area or the aggregate of Level 2
Alteration work areas exceeding 50%
of the total building area within a 12
month period.

Level 1 Alterations and repairs are
not included in the calculation of the
work area as they are not

oreconfigured el emeght

CHANGE OF
OCCUPANCY
Chapter 9

FOR DISCUSSION

The purpose of Chapter 9 is to provide
regulations addressing changes of
occupancy or occupancy classifications
within existing buildings.

The intent is to provide a reasonable
degree of safety to the public and building
occupants without mandating the building
conform to all the provisions for new
construction.




Slide 151

Slide 152

Slide 153

ScoPE 6§ 901.1

The provisions of this chapter shall
apply where a change of occupancy
occurs, as defined in Section 202,
including:

Where the occupancy classification
is not changed, or

Where there is a change in
occupancy classification or the
occupancy group designation
changes.

CHANGE IN OCCUPANCY WITH NO
CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY
CLASSIFICATION 0 901.2

A change in occupancy, as defined in
Section 202, with no change of occupancy
classification shall not be made to any
structure that will subject the structure to
any special provisions of the applicable
Florida Building Code , including the
provisions of Sections 902 through 911,
without the approval of the code official. A
certificate of occupancy shall be issued
where it has been determined that the
requirements for the change in occupancy
have been met.

REPAIR & ALTERATION WITH NO
CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY 0 901.2.1

Any repair or alteration work
undertaken in connection with a
change of occupancy that does not
involve a change of occupancy
classification shall conform to the
applicable requirements for the work
as classified in Chapter 4 and to the
requirements of Sections 902
through 911.




Slide 154

Slide 155

Slide 156

CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY
CLASSIFICATION 6 901.3

Where the occupancy classification of
a building changes, the provisions of
Sections 902 through 912 shall
apply. This includes a change of
occupancy classification within a
group as well as a change of
occupancy classification from one
group to a different group.

PARTIAL CHANGE OF
OccuUPANCY 6 901.3.1

Where a portion of an existing
building is changed to a new
occupancy classification, Section 912
shall apply.

CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY
REQUIRED 6 901.4

A certificate of occupancy shall be
issued where a change of occupancy
occurs that results in being classified
as a different occupancy
classification as determined by the
Florida Building Code - Building .




Slide 157

Slide 158

Slide 159

SPECIAL USE &
OCCUPANCY
Section 902

COMPLIANCE WITH THE
BUILDING CODE 6 902.1

Where the character or use of an
existing building or part of an
existing building is changed to one of
the following special occupancy
categories as defined in Chapter 4 of
the Florida Building Code, Building,
the building shall comply with all of
the applicable requirements of the
Florida Building Code - Building .

COMPLIANCE WITH THE BUILDING
CODE 6 902.1¢ continuep

Covered mall buildings.

Atriums.

Motor vehicle related occupancies.
Aircraft related occupancies.
Motion picture projection rooms.
Stages and platforms.

Special amusement buildings.
Incidental use areas.

Hazardous materials.




Slide 160

Slide 161

Slide 162

CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY
CLASSIFICATION
Section 912

GENERAL 8 912.1

The provisions of this section shall apply to
buildings or portions thereof undergoing a change
of occupancy classification. This includes a
change of occupancy classification within a group
as well as a change of occupancy classification
from one group to a different group. Such
buildings shall also comply with Sections 902
through 911. The application of requirements for
the change of occupancy shall be as set forth in
Sections 912.1.1 through 912.1.4. A change of
occupancy, as defined in Section 202, without a
corresponding change of occupancy classification
shall comply with section 901.2.

COMPLIANCE WITH CH. 8 8
912.1.1

The requirements of Chapter 8 shall
be applicable throughout the
building for the new occupancy
classification based on the
separation conditions set forth in
Sections 912.1.1.1 and 912.1.1.2.




Slide 163

Slide 164

Slide 165

CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION
WITHOUT SEPARATION 6 912.1.1.1

Where a portion of an existing building is changed
to a new occupancy classification and that portion
is not separated from the remainder of the
building with fire-rated wall/ceiling having a fire-
resistance rating as required in the Florida
Building Code for the separate occupancy, the
entire building shall comply with all of the
requirements of Chapter 8 applied throughout the
building for the most restrictive occupancy
classification in the building and with the
requirements of this chapter.

CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION
WITH SEPARATION 6 912.1.1.2

Where a portion of an existing building
that is changed to a new occupancy
classification and that portion is
separated from the remainder of the
building with fire barriers having a fire-
resistance rating as required in the
Florida Building Code for the separate
occupancy, that portion shall comply with
all the requirements of Chapter 8 for the
new occupancy classification and with the
requirements of this chapter.

CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY
CLASSIFICATION BASED ON HAZARD
CATEGORY 0 912.1.3

The relative degree of hazard
between different occupancy
classifications shall be determined in
accordance with the category
specified in Tables 912.4, 912.5 and
912.6. Such a determination shall be
the basis for the application of
Sections 912.4 through 912.7.




Slide 166

Slide 167

Slide 168

TABLE 912.4

MEANS OF EGRESS HAZARD CATEGORIES

OCCUPANCY
RELATIVE HAZARD CLASSIFICATIONS
1 (Highest Hazard) H
2 A 12, 1-3
3 D, E, I-1. M, R-1, R-2, R4
4 B. F-1, R-3, S-1
5 (Lowest Hazard) F2 52 U

TABLE 912.5

HEIGHTS AND AREAS HAZARD CATEGORIES

RELATIVE HAZARD OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATIONS
1 {Highest Hazard) H
2 A1 A2 A3 A4 | R1,R-2, R4
3 E,F-1,81,MD
4 {Lowest Hazard) B,F-2 52 A5 R3U
TABLE 912.6

EXPOSURE OF EXTERIOR WALL S HAZARD CATEGORIES

OCCUPANCY

RELATIVE HAZARD CLASSIFICATION
1 (Highest Hazard) H
2 F-1, M, 51
3 A B EILRD

4 (Lowest Hazard) F2 52U




Slide 169

ivation!
Thank you for your participation’

QUESTION”

This concludes This BOAF Continuing
Education Presentation

PALLY)S
‘e
%

e

WU/,
P

23

3697 Lake Emma Road
Lake Mary, FL 33333

www.boaf.net




